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November 17, 2020 
 
Senator Lindsey Graham 
Chairman of the Senate Judiciary Committee 
Dirkson Senate Office Building 
Room 224 
50 Constitution Ave N.E. 
Washington, D.C. 20002 
 
 
Dear Senator Graham, 
 
Congratulations on your re-election to the United States Senate representing the great 
State of South Carolina, and your leadership in getting Judge Amy Barrett confirmed to 
the Supreme Court. President Trump’s nomination of Judge Barret and the Senate 
confirmation of Judge Barrett to the Supreme Court is more than a political victory, it was 
a essential step in protecting our Republic from the leftist agenda of the Democratic 
Party, the “mainstream” fake news media and a handful of would be “oligarch” billionaires 
including Buffett and Gates.  
 
Another vital accomplishment this year is thus far maintaining the Republican Senate 
majority as a fire wall against the leftist agenda of the above coalition. The President’s 
support for that effort with his tireless campaign effort  around the country was vital as 
you recently noted in a Fox interview. Despite unprecedented spending by the opposition 
it now appears that the Republican Senate majority will hold. 
 
Meanwhile all eyes are on Georgia and the two Senate seats subject to the January run 
off. Once again the above leftist coalition will spend unprecedented sums of money and 
will have the full support of the “mainstream” fake news media as it’s PR department. As 
the lyrics of a popular Charlie Daniels song once proclaimed, “the Devil came down to 
Georgia looking for a soul to steal”. In this case it is the soul of the American Republic 
that the devilish left coalition is attempting to steal.The President is seeking a recount in 
Georgia and you are contibuting $1 million to the two Republican Senators in the Georgia 
run off. If one Republican prevails the Republican Party maintains control of the Senate.  
In the House, Republicans have a net gain of seats in defiance of the polls and despite 
record spending by Democrats. This reduces the chance of the leftist agenda succeeding 
in the House, and moderate Democrats are blaming the losses on the ‘progressive” 
agenda.  
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The President is fighting to protect free and fair elections, is contesting some alleged 
outcomes in favor of Biden.  
 
The Presidency would not be in contention today, and the President would have sailed to 
a certain victory but for the following: 
 
1). The frivolous, partisan impeachment that the  Democrats knew would fail in the 
Senate was simply intended to undermine the President’s credibility with swing voters.  
2). The Chinese Communist Party virus was launched against America with the President 
as the primary target. The leftist Democrats and the fake news media used the Chinese 
virus as a excuse to shut down the country and undermine the U.S. economy, the 
President’s signature achievement, and justify massive mail in voting benefiting Democrat 
candidates.  
3). In addition, 250,000 American lives were sacrificed, and the Democrats and news 
media blamed the President for what they and their Chinese Comunist Party co-
conspirators did. The ultimate objective was to undermine the support for the President 
with swing voters, and greatly increase Democratic voter turnout through mail in ballots 
due to the pandemic.  
4). The Democrats and the “fake News” Media  ignored Joe Biden’s complicity in his son 
Hunder Biden’s business deals in China and elsewhere, and refused to question Biden. 
5). The Democrats and news media promoted the “Russia conspiracy” against the 
President and even after it was disproven the media and Democrats continued the scam. 
6). President Trumps sucesses including peace in the Middle East and his nominations 
for the Nobel Peace prize were largely ignored.  
7). Operation Warp Speed was the driving force for development by Pfizer of a virus 
vacine in record time, and now even the FOX headline reads, “Trump and Biden 
Celebrate Vacine.” 
 
Despite all of this, the spending of unprecended sums of money in the electons by the 
leftist establishment, and the endless anti-Trump drumbeat of the media blaming him for 
what they did, the election results are razor thin in the battleground states, and across the 
country.  
 
This is a follow up to my letter to you dated October 16, 2020 (enclosed), and the 
package of related documents delivered to you at your offices at the Russell Senate 
Office Building on October 19, 2020 at 9:10 am (UPS Tracking enclosed). I realize that 
you likely have not seen my letter and package given your enormous commitment of time 
and energy for the sucessful Amy Barrett Supreme Court confirmation process, your re-
election campaign effort and your current efforts to help the President clean up the 
irregularities and outright fraud in the 2020 national election.  
 
I also concluded that you are more likely to see my communications to you if delivered to 
your office for the Senate Judiciary Committee where you likely spend much of your time, 
out of necessity.  
 
 In that October 16th letter to you and the enclosed letters to President Trump dated 
September 30, 2020 and October 2, 2020 I informed you and the President that I was a 
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“Whistle Blower” for the United States Securities & Exchange Commission (SEC) and 
now a Whistle Blower for President Trump against Democrat Billionaire Warren Buffett for 
concealing a well documented claim and liability of $36 billion in his SEC filings, all of the 
members of Buffett’s Board of Directors including Bill Gates, and NBC CEO Stephen 
Burke for failure to correct the omission of $36 billion in liability,  the Democrat 
Leadership including Nancy Pelosi and Maxine Waters for protecting Buffett from justice, 
and the “fake news” media including NBC, the AP and Reuters, for a cover up. 
 
 I also have letters and documents with Fed Ex tracking related to my SEC Complaint that 
I sent to other prominent Democrats, including Elizabeth Warren, Bernie Sanders, 
Congresswoman Alexandria Ocasio-Cortez (“AOC”), Yanna Pressley, and Eric Swallwell. 
None of them responded or took appropriate oversight action.  
 
This despite the fact that I provided them with a copy of a September 27, 2018 letter to 
me from Jane Norberg, Chief of the Office of the (SEC) Whistle Blower thanking me for 
bringing this matter to her attention, opening up a formal “Submission”, asking me to 
provide any additional information, and that I sign a form TCR to officially become a 
Whistle Blower for the SEC. I did.  
 
With the October 16,2020 letter to you and the September 30 and October 2, 2020 letters 
to the President I enclosed a November 12, 2019 Confidential letter to the President 
emailed to him on November 13, 2019 announcing my role as a SEC Whistle Blower and 
now a Whistle Blower for the President against Buffett, “et al” and offered to give him all 
of my SEC Complaint files in order to help him to launch a “Counter Inquiry” to the 
“Impeachment Inquiry”. 
 
The offer and Confidential letter to the President was “hacked” by agents of Buffett and a 
potentially lethal medical retaliation was launched against me when two doctors at the 
Veterans Administration (VA) hospital in Aurora, Colorado were paid off by a “bag man” 
working for Buffett and a Buffett subsidiary the Lubrizol Corporation that incurred the 
undisclosed $36 billion liability due to it’s theft of our company’s intellectual property and 
other unlawful acts against our interests.  
 
(I receive medical care at the VA  because I am a 50% disabled veteran of the Viet Nam 
War).  
 
All of this is discussed in detail in the enclosed October 16th letter to you and the 
enclosed Setember 30th and October 2nd letters to the President. I have also taken the 
liberty of enclosing all of the related documents that were delivered to you and President 
Trump in October. I have also enclosed tracking confirmations. 
 
In October, I also sent similar letters and documents to Senators Cruz, Hawley,Cotton 
and McSally in attempts to help the President and Republican Senators in the 2020 
election effort.  Those letters and tracking are enclosed for your edification. Perhaps you 
could reach out to these other Republican Senators and alert them to my letters and 
packages sent to them. Given the fact their staffs are working from remote and given the 
election turmoil, I doubt they have even seen the packages and letters.  
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I also send letters and the documents to Fox anchors, Sean Hannity, Tucker Carlson and 
Laural Ingraham in attempts to get through to the President and to Republican Senators 
including you. I have enclosed those letters to Fox and tracking confirmations for your 
edification. I’m guessing the Fox anchors did not reach out to the President, you or the 
other Republican Senators. Meanwhile, of the three Fox anchors I reached out to, only 
Sean Hannity seems to be supporting the President’s legal challenges to the election 
irregularities and outright fraud.  
 
In fact, subsequent to my packages arriving, Fox called the Election for Biden and Harris 
despite reports of wide spread voter fraud and irregularities, and the Presidents legal 
efforts to thoughly investigate them in order to protect the integrity of the election.   
 
On Monday, November 9th  I saw your interview with Brooke Singman of Fox and I 
completely agree with all of your points. The media does not decide elections and the 
President can not concede given the wide spread iregularities and out and out criminal 
fraud, 
 
 In effect, if the President were to concede it would be tantamount to turning the United 
States government over to a criminal conspiracy. After that there would never again be a 
chance for fair and honest elections in the United States of America.  
 
The President and the Republican Senate majority, including you Senator are doing the 
absolute right and essential thing. Given the outright criminal attempt to silence me as a 
Whistle Blower for the SEC and the President I can attest to that fact with real authority. 
 
I  have convincing evidence of this potentially lethal retaliation against me for attempting 
to assist the President as a Whistle Blower. I also have proof that the retaliation against 
me is ongoing.I am fully prepared to provide my evidence to you, and to testify before the 
Senate Judiciary Committee. I will also co-operate fully with the DOJ as well. 
 
God Bless you and the President for what you are doing to correct this enormous 
problem to our country and to all Americans, whether the “news media” including Fox 
agrees or not. Unfortunately, at this point it is very obvious that this problem does extend 
to Fox News who are clearly now on the wrong side of history along with the “main 
stream” media, or as the President calls it, “fake news”. 
 
 I believe it is critical that we talk as soon as possible. The retaliation against me is 
ongoing and potentially lethal. I will come to Washington, D.C. at your earliest 
convenience for indepth discussions. I also have and will share with you all of my 
evidentiary files and records, including my SEC Complaint with nine extensions, and my 
detailed FTC complaint against Buffett’s subsidiary the Lubrizol Corporation. 
 
 I have enclosed the Summary Brief for the November 6, 2018 FTC Complaint v Luvbrizol 
Update with Economist Study.  
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Some of my files and evidence include criminal violations of law by a “agent provocateur” 
and “bag man” for Buffett, “et al” and Lubrizol. His name is Carl Hill and I believe he  
bribed the two doctors at the VA Regional Center in Aurora, Colorado to launch the 
medical retaliation against me. Hill is responsible for a computer and email “hacking” 
operation to follow my movements. I also have reason to believe Hill is “tracking” all my 
packages sent by FedEx, UPS, and USPS in order to shadow me closely. He was very 
successful in doing so in Colorado resulting in my contact with FedEx CEO Fred Smith. 
 
Hill is now active here in Michigan and a follow on retaliation against me with the VA 
Hospital in Ann Arbor, Michigan, and a cover up appears to be underway. I do not think it 
would be wise to delay a meeting between us.  
 
I would also like to have a meeting with the DOJ as soon as possible. I know the DOJ can 
shelter witnesses and evidence. I am also very concerned about the safety of my family 
and want them protected. 
 
 I am certain that President Trump’s list of people he can trust at this point is very short. I 
think that is very wise. Last year in November I reached out to Senator Mike Crapo and 
the President’s son in law Jerod Kushner in attempts to alert the President to my role as a 
SEC Whistle Blower and to assist him in a “counter inquiry” against the Democratic Party 
Impeachment Inquiry.  
 
In that regard, on November 19th I emailed to Kushner a “Open Letter to President 
Trump” dated November 19,2019 with exhibits and a fax cover describing the proposed 
“Counter Inquiry” strategy and the ongoing fake news media, including NBC Cover Up of 
Buffett’s failure to disclose a $35 billion liability in his SEC filings. On November 21, 2019 
I emailed the “Open Letter” to President Trump at his email address, and forwarded that 
email to Senator Mike Crapo who is Chairman of the Senate Banking Committee, with 
SEC oversight. 
 
I have no idea if Mr. Kushner actually saw my email communication, but it was delivered 
to his email address. In Crapo’s case I did talk to his staff person who sends him emails 
directly to his attention. I was told my email was received and forwarded to him as 
evidenced by the reply of his staffer Courtney Lehosit at 12:44 pm on November 22nd. I 
printed that off from my inbox. Then at 8:56 pm a “Delivery Incomplete” appeared in my 
inbox. Luckily I had printed off Courtney’s reply shortly after it appeared in my inbox eight 
hours earlier. This is prove of “hacking” of my communications with the President and the 
United States Senator responsible for SEC oversight. 
 
I have enclosed copies of both for your edification. 
 
 On December 4, 2019 I faxed this evidence and additional evidence of “hacking” of my 
emails to the President attaching a December 4th letter to Attorney General Willam 
Barr.This was done with assistance of the Assistant Manager Debra Damerst, at FedEx 
in Highlands Ranch, Colorado.(The December 4, 2019 letter to AG Barr is enclosed. In 
return I received a form letter. The AG did not see my fax and December 4, 2019 letter. 
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I also had a security problem at Fed Ex with my confidential SEC and FTC documents 
due to the “invasion” of FedEx in Highlands Ranch, Colorado by Carl Hill, and took the 
matter up directly with Fred Smith the CEO and founder. Smith is a fellow Viet Nam 
veteran and known to be helpful to veterans of the Viet Nam War. After a promising 
beginning things did not work out. 
 
When I asked Smith’s Assistance (he is a well connected Repulican) in reaching out to 
Republican Senators and President Trump to provide my SEC and FTC files for a 
“counter inquiry” and Attorney General Barr for the hacking conspiracy, I was pointedly 
told that it was not in Fed Ex’s interests to help me. 
 
 Later I found out that Smith is a very vocal critic of the President’s trade Policies, and 
especially with China, where Smith wants to market Fed Ex services. Smith is also a 
proponent of electric vehicles, and is Chairman of SAFE (Securing America’s Future 
Energy) a organization led by Smith and retired Generals and Admirals that is promoting 
wide spread use of electric vehicles to make America energy independent and not reliant 
on OPEC and the Middle East.. (President Trump accomplished that through increased 
energy production. The President is also negotiating peace in the Middle East).  
 
I have enclosed some of my communications with Smith and responses from a FedEx 
Vice President and attorney. 
 
Joe Biden is also a fan of electric vehicles, and reportedly has business dealing in China 
with his son Hunter Biden.Warren Buffett is also critical of the Presdent’s China trade 
policies because he has an investment in a Chinese electric car company. If the “Green 
New Deal” was implemented by a Biden presidency the U.S. market for the Chinese 
electric cars Buffett is invested in  would be enormous. Meanwhile, Biden and his son 
have business deals in China.  
 
In fact, the very day that Biden announced his run for the presidentcy the Executive Vice 
President of Lobbying for Comcast, a big tech” company put on a $21 million dinner for 
him. Comcast owns NBC whose CEO at the time was Stephen Burke who serves on 
Buffett’s Board of Directors. 
 
Does this sound like the “old boys club” or the “swamp” the President is trying to drain? 
 
By the way, after the hacking of my November 13, 2019 email attaching the November 
12, 2019 Confidential letter to the President of the USA, and the hacking of my November 
21, 2019 email attaching my November 19th “Open Letter” to the President describing my 
SEC Complaint V Buffett “et al” including Stephen Burke with a forward to Senator Mike 
Crapo Charman of the Senate Banking Committee, Burke announced on December 14th 
that he would retire when his contract expired on August 14, 2020. On January 1, 2020 
Burke resigned as CEO of NBC remaining as Chairman until August 14, 2020. Burke was 
“on the top of his game” at NBC-Universal, and is only 61 years old. 
 
On March 12, 2020 I sent a email string (enclosed) to Warren Buffett, “et al” containing a 
March 5,2020 email to the President, and a reference to the VA medical retaliation 
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against me on the last page for March 12th. The very next day Bill Gates resigned from 
Buffett’s Board of Directors, and Microsoft’s Board of Directors citing other commitments. 
I believe Buffett forwarded the email to Gates who shared it with his lawyers and hit the 
exit on advice of counsel. In May I confronted Gates and then Buffett in emails with my 
theory. NO RESPONSE. Gates knew everything that Burke knew, and I actually 
contacted Gates in April 2019 about his liability as a Board Member for Buffett and the 
non-disclosure of a $35 billion asserted claim. I told Gates that he had two choices. Either 
force Buffett to correct the enormous disclosure omission, or resign from Buffett’s Board.  
Otherwise I would name him in my next SEC Complaint for failure to correct the omission. 
Gates responded in a disengenuous letter from “Todd” a Microsoft Executive Response 
Center.  
 
Gates problem and liability is enormous. The claim and omission  is far greater than $35 
billion. If a civil rico claim or anti-trust claim is upheld in federal court the damages are 
triple, or about $100 billion. Now add in the fact that investors purchased about $116 
billion in Berkshire Hathaway without required disclosure of this huge contingent liability. 
These investors can demand rights of recission and demand their money back. Now 
addin in the investors who held their stock without required dosclosure of this hugely 
material liability and can demand rights of recission and your very likely talking about 
$350 to $400 billion. 
 
Gate’s net worth is about $95 billion, and Buffett’s is about $82.5 billion. Shareholders 
can sue Board Members Buffett and Gates for Gross Negligence, and Violation of 
Fudiciary Duty. Get the picture? 
 
Now add in the fact that some of the most prominent Democrats on the planet, with 
oversight responsibility protected Buffett,Gates and Burke, “et al’ from Justice, and the 
news media, including NBC covered it all up. 
 
Now add in two homicides, my father Otis L. Nelson Jr.,a decorated WW!! Combat 
veteran and Polar Founder in August 2009, my fiance’ Sharon Elizabeth Minnock in June 
2013.  
 
Now, add in that I provided extensive documentary evidence, and tried to get the FBI (as 
recommended to me by a FBI/Mueller investigator), and the Democrat Attorney General 
of Colorado to investigate those two homicides, and other crimes including bankruptcy 
fraud, cyber crime and threats of murder (RICO). Nothing happened. 
 
Now add in two pending federal complaints with the FTC and SEC. 
 
Now add in that the witness in those two federal complaints is a disabled combat veteran 
of the Viet Nam War and was targeted, and is still being targeted in a VA medical 
retaliation. 
 
Now add in the fact that that witness/veteran tried to help the President of the United 
States Donald J. Trump as a Whistle Blower when the Democrats were launching a 
frivoulous, partisan “inpeachment inquiry” with one purpose and one purchase only, to 
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discredit the President of the United States and defeat him in  the 2020 national elections, 
and defeat the Republican Senate majority as well, and take over the US government, 
and destroy the United States Constitutional Republic and replace it with a Marxtist 
Oligarchy run by billionaires at the top. 
 
In closing, I would appreciate a phone call from you at your earliest convenience. As I 
stated in my October 16th letter to you I moved back home to Michigan in early July and 
opened a two bedroom apartment in Lansing, Michigan the capitol of the state. 
 
My address is 2730 Senate Drive, Apartment # 5, Lansing, Michigan 48912. The most 
secure phone number I have is a new number, 1-517-974-5524. Please call me or have a 
staff member call me to initiate contact. Email is not secure. 
 
I will be pleased to fly to Washington, D.C. to meet with you, and also hopefully to meet 
with Willam Barr, and the DOJ if you can assist me in arranging a consultation. 
 
  
Mark L. Nelson, 
 
 
 
Chairman, President & CEO 
Polar Molecular Holding Corporation 
www.duraltcomplaint.com, 
 www.pmhcglobal.com   
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
 
 


